AGENDA ITEMS . j Council Meeting Date:
Check ReferenceNo. n/a | Monday, March 24, 2025
Department: ~ Parks and_,RéCr.eation ' e e

oy ik e : Public Hearing:
Fund Number/Department Number: 6200]; . ek i i
BACKGROUND: Fun Junktion Park pfaygrdund, located at 983 Simpson Ditch Road, is a popﬁlar outdoor

recreation area and the ECPC Parks and Recreation's most used playground. No major repairs
have been done to this playground since the installation in 2016.

i p 4 One Time D Recurring

Financial Impact:

Comments:

Analysis: Per the Interlocal Agreement, Fun Junktion is 100% County funded. The safety surface is in dire
need of repair and has caused the park to shut down. The County has approved $70,000 from
contigency to make up the difference for repair to the park.

Department Head Increase expenditure account 106200.7300 for $70,000 for the completion of the playground
Recommendation: safety surface replacement at Fun Junktion Park.

Attachments: |§| Yes D No

Reviewed by:

. FINANCE DEPT OFFICE USE

Department Hea

Date: O Recommend for Approval
Finance Officer:
\
| Date /
; City Manager: O Do not recommend

Date: /




AMENDMENT TO FISCAL YEAR 2025 BUDGET ORDINANCE

CITY OF ELIZABETH CITY

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Elizabeth City, North Carolina:

SECTION I.

Section Il.

To amend the Budget Ordinance for Fiscal Year 2025, the appropriations are to

be changed as follows:

Account # Department / Account Title Decrease Increase
10-6200-7300 |Capital Improvement (Parks & Recreation) S 70,000.00
Total| $ - $  70,000.00
Total Change in Expenses $ 70,000.00

To amend Fiscal Year 2025 Budget Ordinance, the anticipated revenues are to be changed as

follows:
Account # Department/Account Title Decrease Increase
10-3500-6200 |Pasquotank County Recreation Fee S 70,000.00
Total| $ . $  70,000.00
Total Change in Revenues S 70,000.00

ADOPTED, this 24th day of March 2025

Attest:

E. Kirk Rivers,
Mayor

April Onley, NCCMC

City Clerk
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M Gma|| April Onley <aonley@elizabethcitync.gov>

Fwd: 03-03-25 Approval of Funding for Turf at Fun Junktion

Stacy Williams <swilliams@elizabethcitync.gov> Fri, Mar 21, 2025 at 3:36 PM
To: April Onley <aonley@elizabethcitync.gov>

Stacy Williams, CPRP
Interim Director of Parks and Recreation
| Senior Center & Special Events Superintendent
| ECPC Parks and Recreation
T (252)335-4323/ C (252) 339-9073

MIWEEN

|
| .
i "Alone we can do so little; together we can do so much."” — Helen Keller.

---------- Forwarded message —---—---

From: Lynn Scott <scotti@co.pasquotank.nc.us>

Date: Tue, Mar 4, 2025 at 11:27 AM

Subject: 03-03-25 Approval of Funding for Turf at Fun Junktion
To: Stacy Williams <swilliams@elizabethcitync.gov>

Hey Stacy,
|
|
|

My Board approved the following item at its meeting last night: Hopefully, this will suffice until the minutes are
complete. Lynn

7f. Approval of Replacing Turf for Fun Junction Playground

Interim Parks and Recreation Director Stacy Williams has requested additional funding for turf replacement
for the Fun Junktion playground. Fun Junktion is a County park, and the County would be responsible for
100% of the cost of this capital project. Over time, holes have developed throughout the playground's turf,
posing both a safety hazard and a liability concern.

1of3 3/21/2025, 3:44 PM
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Grounds Pro was the low bidder at $119,500, and $49,500 is available in the Capital Outlay Improvements
Account that was approved in the Fiscal Year 2024-25 budget. The Finance Committee has recommended
approval of the request to hire Ground Pros to replace the turf using $70,000 in Contingency Funds and

approval of the budget amendment below.

Increase 010.6130.5500.00 Capital Outlay $70,000
Decrease 010.6900.5991.00 Contingency $70,000

Contingency $70,000
Current Budget $49,500
Turf Replacement $119,500

From: Stacy Williams <swilliams@elizabethcitync.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, March 4, 2025 11:12 AM

To: Lynn Scott <scottl@co.pasquotank.nc.us>

Subject: [External] Re: [External] Minutes

Thanks ma'am!

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 4, 2025, at 9:48 AM, Lynn Scott <scotti@co.pasquotank.nc.us> wrote:

I'll get you something shortly. Lynn

From: Stacy Williams <swilliams@elizabethcitync.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, March 4, 2025 9:25 AM

To: Lynn Scott <scotti@co.pasquotank.nc.us>

Subject: [External] Minutes

Can | get a copy of the minutes/approval for the additional funding request for Fun Junktion? | need to

upload it with my paperwork to get this job moving.

3/21/2025, 3:44 PM




